Multiple Equipment, Contract 2009-01

Bid Opening September 21, 2009 10:00am

Bidders Name Equipment Bid Year / Model Unit Price Trade - in Tax Total Bid
New Tec, LLC 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
970 Hwy 395 North 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Kettle Falls, WA 99141 1 - Car Tilt Trailer 2009 / Olympic Trailer OM14-2E $5,990.00 $455.24 $6,445.24
1-509-738-6621 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller No Bid
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Central Machinery Sales, Inc. 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
1708 E James ST 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Pasco, WA 99301 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-547-9003 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller 2009 / JCB VMT 260 $39,900.00 ($5,000.00) $2,687.30 | $37,587.30
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Titan Truck 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
N 605 Fancher Rd. 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Spokane, WA 99212 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-755-5037 2 - Snow Plow V Style 2009 / Western $5400 X 2 $939.60 $11,739.60
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller No Bid
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Rowand Machinery Company 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom 2009 / Superior Broom DT80J $46,534.00 ($7,700.00) $2,990.22 | $41,824.22
P.O. Box 19099 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Spokane, WA 99219 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-547-8813 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller 2009 / Dynapac CC122 $32,000.00 ($1,200.00) $2,371.60 | $33,171.60
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
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Bidders Name Equipment Bid Year / Model Unit Price Trade - in Tax Total Bid
Cobalt Truck Equipment 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
4620 E Trent Ave. 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Spokane, WA 99212 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-534-0446 2 - Snow Plow V Style 2009 / Fisher 8 1/2 Xtreme V $4745X 2 $730.73 $10,220.73
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller No Bid
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Fox Trailer 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
6525 W. Seltice 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Post Falls, ID 83854 1 - Car Tilt Trailer 2010/ $5,525.00 $5,525.00
1-208-773-6588 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller No Bid
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Mid-Mountain Machinery, Inc. 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
7916 West Sunset Hwy 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer 2010 / Trail-EZE TE501 $40650 X 2 (901-$1500, 904-$1500, 931-$500) $5,990.60 | $83,790.60
Spokane,WA 99224 1- Car Tilt Trailer 2010/ Felling FT-12 $8,000.00 $616.00 $8,616.00
1-509-838-3547 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller 2009 / Bomag BW120AD-4 $33,550.00 ($700.00) $2,529.45 | $35,379.45
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Mid-Mountain Machinery, Inc. 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
7916 West Sunset Hwy 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer 2010/ Felling FT-50-3T $39750 X 2 (901-$1500, 904-$1500, 931-$500) $5,852.00 | $81,852.00
Spokane,WA 99224 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-838-3547 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller 2007 / Bomag BW120AD-4 / 50hrs $22,500.00 ($700.00) $1,678.60 | $23,478.60
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
United Rentals 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom 2009 / Sweepmaster 250 $51,372.00 ($8,000.00) 3426.39 | $46,798.39
13558 N Frontage Rd E 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Moses Lake,WA 98837 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-764-8061 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller 2009 / Wacker RD 27-120 $38,660.00 ($2,000.00) 2896.14 | $39,556.14
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
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Clyde/West, Inc. 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom 2009 / Broce RCT 350 $47,036.88 ($11,000.00) 2774.83 $38,811.71
E 3107 Trent Ave 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Spokane,WA 99202 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-534-5933 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller No Bid
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Western States Equipment Co. 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
4625 E Trent Ave 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Spokane,WA 99212 1 - Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-535-1744 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller 2009 / CAT CB24 $33,214.00 ($3,000.00) 2296.26 | $32,510.26
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Star Rentals Inc. 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
6812 E Desmet 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer 2009 / Trail-Eze TE501 $41956 X2 | (901-$2000, 904-$2000, 931-52000) | $5,999.23 | $83,911.23
Spokane,WA 99212 1- Car Tilt Trailer No Bid
1-509-924-8080 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller 2009 / Bomag BW120AD-4 $34,389.00 ($2,000.00) 2493.96 | $34,882.96
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
Owens Equipment Company 1 - Self-Propelled Power Broom No Bid
8721 South 218 Street 2 - Sliding 3 Axle Trailer No Bid
Kent,WA 98031 1 - Car Tilt Trailer 2009 / JLG Triple L1014 $11,820.00 $1,122.90 |$12,942.90
1-509-389-9529 2 - Snow Plow V Style No Bid
1 - Double Drum Vibratory Roller No Bid
1 - HydroSeeder No Bid
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