

ERP - 801 ADAMS COUNTY 2021 COUNTY WIDE CRUSHING PROJECT BID TABULATION Opened 2-22-2021

Item #	Quantity	Unit	Item Description	Engineer Estimate		DeAtley Crushing Co.		4-R Equipment LLC		Western Construction Of Lewiston, Inc		Peak Sand & Gravel		Woods Crushing & Hauling		NO BID Seubert Excavators, Inc		Averages			
				Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost	Unit Price	Item Cost
<b>Base Bid - Ralston Site #3 --- 22,000 Ton</b>																					
1	3,500	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Base Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 28,875.00	\$ 5.07	\$ 17,745.00	\$ 5.85	\$ 20,475.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 17,500.00	\$ 7.50	\$ 26,250.00	\$ 6.95	\$ 24,325.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.07	\$ 21,259.00		
2	15,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 123,750.00	\$ 5.51	\$ 82,650.00	\$ 6.25	\$ 93,750.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 90,000.00	\$ 7.30	\$ 109,500.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 150,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.01	\$ 105,180.00		
3	3,500	Ton	Coverstone Maintenance	\$ 10.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 7.43	\$ 26,005.00	\$ 9.25	\$ 32,375.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 24,500.00	\$ 7.30	\$ 25,550.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.20	\$ 28,686.00		
<b>Base Bid -Stelzer Site # 4 --- 32,000 Ton</b>																					
4	4,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Base Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 33,000.00	\$ 6.43	\$ 25,720.00	\$ 8.15	\$ 32,600.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 28,000.00	\$ 10.95	\$ 43,800.00	\$ 7.15	\$ 28,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.94	\$ 31,744.00		
5	20,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 165,000.00	\$ 6.66	\$ 133,200.00	\$ 8.35	\$ 167,000.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 10.95	\$ 219,000.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 197,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.76	\$ 175,240.00		
6	8,000	Ton	Coverstone Maintenance	\$ 10.00	\$ 80,000.00	\$ 8.05	\$ 64,400.00	\$ 11.10	\$ 88,800.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 72,000.00	\$ 10.95	\$ 87,600.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 78,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 9.79	\$ 78,320.00		
<b>Base Bid -Roxboro Site #14 --- 29,000 Ton</b>																					
7	2,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Base Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 6.90	\$ 13,800.00	\$ 5.55	\$ 11,100.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7.75	\$ 15,500.00	\$ 6.95	\$ 13,900.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6.43	\$ 12,860.00		
8	20,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 165,000.00	\$ 6.43	\$ 128,600.00	\$ 5.15	\$ 103,000.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 7.75	\$ 155,000.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.07	\$ 141,320.00		
9	7,000	Ton	Coverstone Maintenance	\$ 10.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ 6.41	\$ 44,870.00	\$ 7.50	\$ 52,500.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 49,000.00	\$ 7.75	\$ 54,250.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.73	\$ 54,124.00		
<b>Base Bid -Marcellus Site #17 --- 28,000 Ton</b>																					
10	25,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 206,250.00	\$ 6.32	\$ 158,000.00	\$ 6.55	\$ 163,750.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 9.45	\$ 236,250.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 246,250.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.03	\$ 200,850.00		
11	3,000	Ton	Coverstone Maintenance	\$ 10.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 8.58	\$ 25,740.00	\$ 7.85	\$ 23,550.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$ 9.45	\$ 28,350.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 29,550.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.95	\$ 26,838.00		
<b>Base Bid -Haase Site #23 --- 32,000 Ton</b>																					
12	25,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 206,250.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 162,500.00	\$ 6.35	\$ 158,750.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 8.20	\$ 205,000.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 246,250.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.78	\$ 194,500.00		
13	7,000	Ton	Coverstone Maintenance	\$ 10.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ 8.50	\$ 59,500.00	\$ 8.10	\$ 56,700.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 63,000.00	\$ 8.20	\$ 57,400.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 68,950.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.73	\$ 61,110.00		
<b>Base Bid -Lind-Hatton Site #53 ---49,660 Ton</b>																					
14	5,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Base Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 41,250.00	\$ 6.31	\$ 31,550.00	\$ 6.30	\$ 31,500.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 10.30	\$ 51,500.00	\$ 7.15	\$ 35,750.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7.41	\$ 37,060.00		
15	30,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 247,500.00	\$ 7.22	\$ 216,600.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 180,000.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 240,000.00	\$ 10.30	\$ 309,000.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 295,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.27	\$ 248,220.00		
16	14,660	Ton	Coverstone Maintenance	\$ 10.00	\$ 146,600.00	\$ 6.07	\$ 88,986.20	\$ 8.75	\$ 128,275.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 131,940.00	\$ 10.30	\$ 150,998.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 144,401.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.79	\$ 128,920.04		
<b>Misc.</b>																					
17	1	Dollars	Minor Change	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00		
18	1	LS	SPCC Plan	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 36,058.00	\$ 36,058.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,061.60	\$ 10,061.60		
					<b>\$ 1,665,476.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,280,617.20</b>		<b>\$ 1,347,626.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,503,999.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,779,949.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,869,277.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>\$ 1,556,293.64</b>		
<b>Alternate Bid "A"</b>																					
Item #	Quantity	Unit	Item Description																		
<b>Alternate Bid "A" -Ritzville Site # 50 --- 22,000 Ton</b>																					
1	16,000	Ton	Crushed Surfacing Top Course	\$ 8.25	\$ 132,000.00	\$ 6.54	\$ 104,640.00	\$ 6.10	\$ 97,600.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 128,000.00	\$ 9.15	\$ 146,400.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 157,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.27	\$ 126,848.00		
2	6,000	Ton	Coverstone Maintenance	\$ 10.00	\$ 60,000.00	\$ 7.22	\$ 43,320.00	\$ 8.25	\$ 49,500.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 54,000.00	\$ 9.15	\$ 54,900.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 59,100.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.79	\$ 52,164.00		
<b>Misc.</b>																					
3	1	Dollars	Minor Change	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.00		
					<b>\$ 192,001.00</b>		<b>\$ 147,961.00</b>		<b>\$ 147,101.00</b>		<b>\$ 182,001.00</b>		<b>\$ 201,301.00</b>		<b>\$ 216,701.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>\$ 179,013.00</b>		
					<b>\$ 1,857,477.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,428,578.20</b>		<b>\$ 1,494,727.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,686,000.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,981,250.00</b>		<b>\$ 2,085,978.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>\$ 1,735,306.64</b>		